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.Network mask In computer networking, a network mask is the smallest number in a bit field of two
or more contiguous bytes that, if set to all-zero bits, is guaranteed to result in the remaining area
being a valid IP address. A network mask of all zeros results in all hosts on the local network being
unable to resolve the hostname of a remote computer. It is most commonly used to allow the local
network to connect to the Internet via a router/firewall with a single subnet, without being able to
see the rest of the network. The same applies to an IP address with only the initial one or two high
order bytes set to 1. This type of addressing is used for "narrow" or "partial" subnet. A wide subnet
has more contiguous bytes (bits) set to 1. In the same manner, a partial subnet has fewer contiguous
1 bits set. For example, if the IP address is 10.0.0.0, the network mask of 10.0.0.0 will result in only
10.0.0.0—the host with the IP address of 10.0.0.0 can see only the hosts with IP addresses from
10.0.0.0 to 10.0.0.255, no other hosts on the network can be resolved. Notation The most common
notation for the network mask is a single octet with all bits set to 1. This is equivalent to
255.255.255.0. In most common implementations of the Internet Protocol, network masks of all
zeros and all ones are interpreted differently. If the network mask is all zero, all hosts in the local
subnet will not be able to resolve the hostname of a host with a non-zero IP address. In contrast, if
the network mask is all ones, all hosts in the local subnet will be able to resolve any non-local IP
addresses. The notation for the network mask is a single octet with all bits set to 1. This is equivalent
to 255.255.255.0. In most common implementations of the Internet Protocol, network masks of all
zeros and all ones are interpreted differently. If the network mask is all zero, all hosts in the local
subnet will not be able to resolve the hostname of a host with a non-zero IP address. In contrast, if
the network mask is all ones, all hosts in the local subnet will
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